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3 Beds | 3.0 Baths | 1217 Sqft 
$148,500.00 

Bella Piazza combines the comfort of home with the ambience of a fine resort. 
With its Mediterranean accented architecture and tile roofs, this resort is easily 
accessible to all that Central Florida has to offer. With a centrally located 
clubhouse, 2 resort-style pools including a gated water playground and pool 
cabana’s, along with a state-of-the-art fitness center, business center and games 
room there’s plenty of activities for all to enjoy. Welcome to 907 Charo 
Parkway, #926, a Roma model floor plan offering 3 Bedroom and 3 
Bathrooms, all perfectly placed into a 1,217 Sq.Ft. and being offer fully-
furnished or “turn-key”. This unit is located on the second floor via stairs or 
elevator access, which offers a split floor plan, including Master Suite and 2 
supporting en-suites, all located off the central and open living area, with 
integrated kitchen. Featuring granite countertops, cherry wood cabinets, 
porcelain tile throughout the kitchen, dining, living and bathrooms, this 
property provides an upscale luxury within, as well as throughout the resort. 
The private balcony provides a wonderful South-West facing view overlooking 
the resorts second pool, complete with spa and cabanas. For those looking to 
utilize as a second home, this unit comes with plenty of accessible storage 
including a large owners closet off the Master bathroom. Located just 0.3 miles 
from Berry Town Center, anchored by Publix supermarket, there’s also sit-
down restaurants available courtesy of Applebees and iHop, or if you prefer a 
snack-to-go, you can select from a multitude of culinary delights.


